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1. Regular Cleaning
     Sweep: Use a broom or a leaf blower to remove dirt, 
leaves, and debris from the surface of the pavers.
     Wash: Clean the pavers with a mild detergent solution 
and water. Use a soft-bristle brush to scrub away any 
stains. Rinse thoroughly with clean water.
     Pressure Washing: For tougher cleaning, use a low 
pressure washer (maximum 1,600 psi).

2. Stain Removal
     Oil and Grease: For oil and grease stains, apply a 
degreasing agent and scrub with a soft-bristle brush. Rinse 
well with water.
     Organic Stains: For stains caused by organic matter 
like food, plants, or leaves, use a mixture of water and 
bleach (1:10 ratio). Apply the solution, let it sit for a few 
minutes, then scrub and rinse thoroughly.

3. Inspect for Damage
     Regularly inspect the pavers for cracks or chips. If you 
find any, consider replacing the damaged pavers to 
prevent further issues.

4. Preventive Measures
     Seal the Pavers: While porcelain pavers are naturally 
resistant to staining and moisture, sealing them can 
provide extra protection. Apply a high-quality sealer 
every 1-2 years.
     Use Furniture Pads: Place pads under furniture legs to 
prevent scratches and damage to the pavers.
     Avoid Harsh Chemicals: Refrain from using harsh 
chemicals or acidic cleaners, as they can damage the 
surface of the pavers.

Routine Maintenance and Care:

5. Seasonal Care
     Winter Care: In colder climates, avoid using metal 
shovels or sharp tools to remove snow and ice. Instead, 
use a plastic shovel and consider applying a non-corrosive 
de-icer.
     Spring and Summer Care: During warmer months, 
clean the pavers more frequently to prevent the buildup of 
pollen, dust, and other debris.

6. SkyJack Pedestals
     Leveling: Periodically check the level of the pavers as 
settling of the building may cause the pavers to shift.  If 
you notice any unevenness or rocking pavers, adjust the 
height of the pedestals to maintain a flat, stable surface.  
You can use our hand tool in order to adjust the pedestals 
from on top of the pavers without having to remove the 
pavers.  You may also need to add rubber shims to ensure 
all of the paver corners are flush.

7. Professional Maintenance
     Periodic Professional Cleaning: Schedule professional 
cleaning and maintenance every few years to ensure the 
longevity and appearance of your pavers. Professional 
services can provide deep cleaning and resealing if 
needed.

By following these steps, you can keep your porcelain 
paver pedestals looking pristine and functioning well. 
Enjoy your skydeck! 

https://skydeckusa.com/paver-pedestal-product-calculator/
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